
Subject: Re: The Three, Which one are you?
Posted by Sniper_De7 on Thu, 10 Aug 2006 03:20:42 GMT
View Forum Message <> Reply to Message

when you say "which one of these three are you" and only three are available none of which say
"something different than what i posted" that is classifying. It'd be the same way if there was a
vote saying are you gay or are you straight. Just not enough options and you aren't suggesting
that there is more beyond the three, especially since you say "how come you aren't choosing one
of the three?" Maybe because a person is something completely different? Or haven't you thought
of that.

Also...
Darker wrote on Wed, 09 August 2006 19:34Everyones different mrpirate, some people read
quicker and do not look closely at smaller things like that. But don't stress about it.

Quote:These people are more likely to try to make someone else look stupid, perhaps because
they are a threat to them in a way or other unknown reasons. And more oftenly not very
considerate

Alot of this activity is coming from you, MrPirate. You know I'm not the Moee character, yet you
have Implied that you think I might be him.

Not to mention, you will not tell us what you think you are closest to. Afraid to admit is also a way
of the Asswiser.

when you say "this activity" you are saying he is doing the suggested (this being "people...try to
make someone else look stupid" If he WASN'T doing this, you wouldn't have said he was doing it,
would you? You also didn't say why being like moe is necessarily something negative.

when you say "the way of" you imply he is doing something that an asswiser would do. "An
asswiser's way would do this. Thus, if you do this, too, you are in the way of an asswiser"

you imply that asswiser is bad, just by the name. Yes, having the word ass, and then adding wiser
on it, implies you are saying it is a bad thing. If I called you a fuckwit, fuckwit, are you going to
think it may not be an insult? Even so, you also imply being an asswiser is bad because you say
in your own opinions so and so is bad, and you also say that this so and so is apparently the ways
of an asswiser, so yes, you are very much implying asswiser as being bad.

edit:
Oh I just reread I guess at some point someone said asswiser instead of the original "wiseasser"
you put in. Which would go with being a wiseass, which is a bad thing globally. So uh, yeah...
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